
 6826 OF Bid Opening:
2:00pm

October 30, 2023

Code Make Model Year Body style Drive Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine
FP1 Ford Police Interceptor Utility 2024 3.3L HEV AWD 3.3L  V6 FFV AWD 3.0L EcoBoost® AWD 3.3L HEV AWD 3.3L  V6 FFV AWD 3.0L EcoBoost® AWD

FP1A Ford Police Interceptor Utility 2024 SUV AWD 42,389.00$                     39,869.00$                      43,563.00$                      42,548.00$                                     40,022.00$                  43,396.00$                    
FP2 Ford F150 Police Responder 2024 3.5L EcoBoost® V6 3.5L EcoBoost® V6
FP2A Ford F150 Police Responder 2024 Truck 4x2 No bid No bid
FP2A Ford F150 Police Responder 2024 Truck 4x4 45,146.00$                     45,379.00$                                     

FP3 Ford F150 SSV 2024  3.5L Power Boostv6 
Hybrid 3.5L Ecoboost V6 5.0L V8 3.5L Power Boostv6 Hybrid 3.5L Ecoboost V6 5.0L V8

FP3A Ford F150 SSV 2024 Truck 4x2 No bid No bid
FP3B Ford F150 SSV 2024 Truck 4x4 No bid No bid
FP4 Ford Expedition /MAX SSV 2024 3.5L Eco Boost V6 3.5L Eco Boost V6

FP4A Ford Expedition SSV 2024 SUV 4x2 46,340.00$                     46,233.00$                                     
FP4B Ford Expedition SSV 2024 SUV 4x4 49,027.00$                     48,960.00$                                     
FP4C Ford Expedition Max SSV 2024 SUV 4x2 48,955.00$                     48,838.00$                                     
FP4D Ford Expedition Max SSV 2024 SUV 4x4 51,692.00$                     51,575.00$                                     
FP5 Ford Transit Prisoner Transport 2024 3.5L Eco Boost V6 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco Boost V6 3.5L V6

FP5A Ford Transit Prisoner Transport 2024 VAN AWD 46,256.00$                  48,546.00$                      No bid No bid

FP6 Ford F150 Lightning Pro SSV 452HP 452HP
FP6A Ford F150 Lightning Pro SSV 2024 Truck 4x2 No bid No bid No bid No bid
FP6B Ford F150 Lightning Pro SSV 2024 Truck 4x4 45,763.00$                     55,488.00$                         45,904.00$                                     55,630.00$                     

(Total calculated using vehicles that all vendors bid on) Total: $468,232 $468,485

580HP w/ Extended Range

Anderson Ford Sid dillon Ford

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that 
may have not been released at the time of this bid.

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP
8.00% 5% (except 0% on Lightning)
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